T qaERe www.govtpreésmp.nic.in
Q o TR @ fov 5w R

HH® 479] i, YERAR, Tl 27 o 2015—3URHT 6, TF 1937

fafy o faurh = faam
e, R 27 R 2015

E 8099—331—3361%11—31—(91.)~awfa.—n€21m faam | o Frefefea sifufam foa w s 1 W,. 2015
F TR TR H AN W € gH ¢, UGN SHWERY F SHER F o yeiE fan s R

HYeY % TSI & Y ¥ a9 ARIMER,
YT areE, atfafted |t

957



Yy SIS, T 27 WK 2015

.958

WA L T 0%

WWW(W)WWWW 08y

Re.
22

R
(£

ferorr-—g=t

qT T
IRiY®

i = e g

o
o 3R o1 wimior wer (Freem aen dar-vr fafEm)
aifafmd, g]R& T HINEH
TEIYT ST 1 AR g ®4 H wg i, z%‘%amquwﬁm
YRI © 1 GEA.
o
e SIR o1 Wi=Aior FHAR hedar STR Ui, 23R8 w1 HeE

HEAYRY TS h1 A ¢ &9 H F9 Afufm, 2’38 &1 ¢ 1 HeA.
U 3 R g} G

g 9’
émaq(ﬁrﬁamaﬁtwm) aAfafram, zamwwhm

nmmaﬁw@mﬁﬁaaﬁuﬁw, zz\somawiﬁrwhuﬁ.

Y © 3R 33w/ GWEA
FHEAT A, (%< T e

TR TS9 H AF] g€ €9 § Hsry fufam, zaxc?ﬂaawwhm
YRI g4, €& 3T W I HHIEM.

9T B¢
sireifire faare sfufam, %o &1 deiem

nmmﬁm@wﬁ%ﬁaﬂww Q%\s?ﬂzxwwﬁ%ﬂ

YW e, W, 3 U2 HI GIE.

A 9
ST F Jardt FHER (FEnm o fafama it dan o)
Afafay, e &1 AINEA

HEAYRE TS HY ] B T H FE AREEE, 30% H 30 1 A
U ¥ W HEEE,



qegey qoed, faie 27 7aw) 2015 _ 958 (1)

T TS o
nﬁaqﬁag?mﬂaﬁaﬁw zaazw#@m-

¥,  HEIURY U9 HI AF] ¢ &9 § Hsra sifufam, zzazmwmmﬁsﬁ
™. URT 3 W HEEA V
| st |
Hiqua g7 fafmEl & orefie srauell 1y qen foeRy 61 SueE
€. TR USg H wiqwa gm faftrlil ¥ erefiw st 1 weE M.
RICICC
ﬁfwwﬁvﬁﬁ%qwamﬁfwwaﬁﬁaﬁmw
foT M 9 ®e

o, weyew TS H wiawm gu faftel & o1l faf= e &t 9l & duror qen
fafier R @t faerfort yeqa fFe s @ e

TN TIRE
A | fafay swey
g¢. T I W =t ufe.
gR. HigTEAl # g fFan s _
Heayawr Afufaw

SHIh ?Z'G"L ?02‘\

Wwﬁ&m(wﬁm)aﬁwuﬁﬁm&a@m Qogq

[ foAi g% STo®R, Ro0%u o Wgufd i ITAHId Wie g8, oFAfd ' 'Weaudyr U ( JrETewr )" ﬁmww, ?o!t\aﬁ
YA GR WP &t T, ]

HERY T W AF] g €9 H—
(W) W SR oFa afi weR (FRSH qo Qor-vd fafrm) SfbfEm, 2336 (23R8 H 9)
(&) et SR o T R e SUER SR, 23R8 (8%%& W 3¢)
() | gm (fafr ok Saoe) sifufem, iz\So (20 & 39)
(=) FREMA AR, 9% (2% F &)
() st foror s, govs (2790 &1 %)
(%) ST var wER (Feem & Rfm st Jor ) afufem, 2ju] (23] & 30)

(um) AR ufeeT wHER sifufem, qReg (RREL F W)
SR Geifa O R an e g faftEl % dew o vl sy e % faw sifufrm,



. 958 (2)

Hegyey o9, e 27 FawR 2015

wferw W iR
' icc A

HeAUSYr TR WY

WM gC wy o
g afufem,
L]RE T RO WHT
Hyier,

" #IRT \9 T T,

ALY T &Y
- WP gC ®U H
FT AtfrEm,
2]%E W R¢ &

oW 3 3 e @ T
wirer.

wammm%fmmaﬁa&ﬁqmﬁm—wmmwﬁ%#ﬂﬁma:—
I Tk
URFR
z.'(z)wﬁmmﬁmmwmmﬁfw (deie) SRyl sues
afufEm, 03y . ~
(R) I HEAYR T H T FHNHE B AG@ § qIW €W

am
o 3 3 gf=mior R (FEsH aur Ja-ve o)
o ofyfrad, ]R8 I WA

R nm&awﬁm@mﬁ a9 3 e wf=min waR (Fraem aur dar-wd fafr)
afufrm, 2338 (2’%E &1 W) (S 39 oI H T6& Ivan a sifufem & 7w @ ffdy }) =1 54
9rT #, 39 9vEr vafua df 4 defaa fean s : '

3. T SHuFRM § W § S9N (3) ¥ wvaw, Frafifed Suum sra e # s, e —

“(3) AR AR TR O 9 e 9 i wrematy 3 iR R s gR e
TR % Faig § $iE el STRW WG <18 e TR0 §, O e ¥4 ¥ SRRt R fean e wner

S

. IR dH
g 3ﬂT 37 AfaTvT HHER FHeAamol SURT STFEE, (/%8 &1 GuieH

¥, HEIRY U I ] U €9 F, o 3T 1 Wi heiehR Heam U ST, R]R8(2%%%
H R¢) (ST 7@ o H T e g9 Sfutem % Tw @ filE ¥) W 5w am § e e svetea
Gfa § deifaq foran st

w, 7o st §—
(TF) 910 3 ¥, 399/ (R) &% WA, Frafafea Squam swswnfia =t s, stefq —

‘() SuuRr () B slafde et s % ¥ g of frd wrem | ygw fRu Sm %
I Y T SR W % o A ufiaes W IuTE orE ok UEt o1 el
=1, St o T59 AR g S 1 TR Afurge g fafafds wi e, foedt frie
g SY gi=mior & o 9 stafdd = femn s’y

(@) um R H, [UER (2) ¥ @M W, Freafaied suuw i @ s, st o—

“(z)wﬁuﬁan%amﬂwmﬁaﬁﬁmﬁ@%mméﬁm@%ﬁ g 4
3t fopu T ol faftor oW @ @ uwy & & erdlie faw e wifm arfadifia
HE g Tt oy @ =ufia g friems, 18 9ma & oy, = T fafea fean
WU, 39 ordid Wive = @ vy H, St fr fafea foeen Swoawn o Ofa
H, St for vow weR g faffde w1 sy, erde e wem.



YR e, f&is 27 TawR 2015

958 (3)

YT IR’
31 g (faframm ok saaes) aifufam, Qe &1 dsiem

€. LAY T I @F] g¢ &9 H, ow g1 (Tafwm aﬁtéﬁr{m) sifufrm, g0e (3RWo  39)
(S 39 91 H 3% vvE w9 ifufm % am S Ffe ®) 9w v H, soe e ssia O § defia
RIS

v, ga st ¥H—

AL T Y
R ®Y X
F=ia afufEm,
2990 T 39 T
YT o 3T L3 WY
k3 H1 )

(TH) o/ @ H, IYURT () & Uvar, Frafafaa 78 suam s ) S, stefq —

“(3) STURT (R) % SITER Wl YR F Yol SMesT wegd AT S W, Snde A feg
WM & A 9 30 T Y FHemafy & Wi Wdiwal st Wi T
FE A IUY HR HA I TR B H SN HE A1 G FA HT IR WA

w1 9 FEiha = g = ghgn s

(@) uR 23 ¥, YR (3) & weaw, Frefafea ¢ Sauw S S, stefq o—

(%) TR (2) F AR Gl THR A gl ST @ FRT WY W, I I % Hay
3, forerh Ty o ST R TR 8, AR ST S ST W fRT R
! A ¥ 3o T it wiamafy % it sTafa <7 o1 SU SR S A1 IH W

Ea § A IHAR B TR 9 W orwla ¥ T wwsht S,

T T e Tedl €, O T T, T deiy ¥ Qur snaed fwan wan ®, W

FE A S F A W TAH B I GGG B H DI AW A H oweed

=

HREHT SfufRE, R¥¢ H TWEA
¢. HEAYRY TS ) O] g &9 T, HREF AUFEE, 2¥¢ (¥¢ H1 €3) (S 39 um § 34
mﬂ@aﬂﬁm%m@ﬁﬁg%) I, 3W WM G, mefaaﬁﬁrﬁwﬁm
feran ST, '
R, T\ Ffufrm H—
(TF) 91 &y H,—

(F) SUHW () F Y FHA G

(‘@)“sﬁum(a)é;wm,ﬁmfﬂﬁaawmwﬁaﬁm Al -—

“(3) () U, R, WY SR ug U ofafde fRe e & ¥ U o, feeh awes gEw

SR ®, Fefafaa w6 @ QU fee 9= & sreadiE w®d g fedl s ram
o, gure #, ¥¢ "9vd ¥ afuw wR wA A ol § s wFh —

(wF) frdlt ot T o & gat 0 are 9 ofuw 7

() fasm siaue w1 e frdl wor i o om0 fawr e 93 @ aifves == <
(F7) e =1 frerey, fodl ware 9 wd % $o €2 ue 4 afuw = €

HAYAY T &HY
WA g ®q A
F=ta stfafem,

LR¥L HT & T

oW &4, §§ 3R
9% THT WML,


lenovo
Sticky Note
Provision for Deemed Registration 

lenovo
Sticky Note
Provision for Deemed Licensing 

Neha.Pandit
Rectangle


958 (4)

Ty TS, i 27 @R 2015

(m)ww'aﬁ,@wﬁmfﬂﬂwwmmmmﬁm
I &1 foran s ofR forelt foret & srfra v W F o e ww Ht
1= ¥ arfuw 7= ©;

(d=) Wlmmm-m%mmﬁaﬁmmwﬁm{

(@) sifrgr, wHERT % W & § AN ki F F SR Ve Af §, S
fr fafea = s, denfta =m.

oqgeRTor —39 SuuT H famrt’” o ae) erdf g S fF amo €% ﬁ IUYRT (¥)
¥ fem w2

(@) N e H—

(F) 399 () ¥, @ve (W) iR Wege &1 a9 foran <g;
(@) 3R (2) & uvan, Frfafaa suar ofa:wnfim =t s, stafq :—
Y () T5T TER, QW-ERI, 3 Afgenst, ﬁgwﬁgﬁﬁaﬂaﬂﬁ%mvﬁﬁﬁﬁ{g

T TH, o T ¢ o Q G & o % o el R sveren fafimfor wiieen
ﬁmaﬂﬁﬁmwﬁw%mmmaﬁwﬁaﬁr%”

() R ] W, SaEr (1) @R TaEe % i W, Frefaiad Seur i st i

fopm S, sl —
(R ). T FHER ), T T shetet o % SN Rt SRER § co R W s
C % HEY 9F w1 fRa § S weie 99 & SH frefafaa @ ) dnfia
T =t woigll wfed g o R ergR §F Snei—

(%) fFel oores &1 < ¥, @mﬁ%wmmmmmmm
F wM % faq ww =&

(ﬁ)ﬁmmﬁmﬁ@maﬁwwmmmmmm
¥ &M & fad s fa

THH 3 —39 TIUR F S ¥ fu—
(*)mm#ﬁamawwmaﬁsﬁaawﬂqama@mm%ﬁm;
(mﬁmﬁﬁwﬁ,mmam@saﬁmmw%mmaﬁx
() forer o gt 1 S fen S % v padt ad § s g

pC RN

zcomﬁwﬁﬁﬁmﬁuﬁmﬁmﬁ%mﬁﬁmmwmﬁ
HHRR & HREHE d wW R ©.



eI TSI, TR 27 T 2015 : 958 (5)

I B8
shenfier faar sifufrm, zﬂmwwﬁ%ﬂ

Ro. IR TSI B TN g€ &9 F oiehfir faare afufem, 13xo (33¥e F Q¥) (S 39 Wi WEAvaw T
H goeh wvar qa furEm % am ¥ ffde ¥) # w@ 9w A, gus wee vt O § et e W T WA X

Fsta rfufm,
S, L% T L¥ &
gR. & sifufrm H,— : : , : -
(TF) uRT 3% H, SR (3) §, WK o A A A F WH R, 9% 3?‘: R @t
e A1 SR A gore Sty et fRy S .
() ¥R Ry = H,—
(%) @vs (%) #, W“@ﬂéﬁaﬁm"%wmm“aﬁﬁﬁw Tt
fer IG;
V(@)@U@(@)%Wﬁ%ﬁﬂﬁfﬁﬁ@v@wﬁam“mﬁ:— .
“ (@) wHHR w1 et F T T i % fe T @ S PR Qe &% & 9yfa
¥ % ford o1 oF A A fuw F IS frst 9m & faw uxw A % sitea
W%wmw%aﬁw%ﬁméaqaﬁnﬁr% Tvﬁ%ﬁa’f‘wﬁw
g‘hf 3.ﬁ_{.n
() a9y T H, SuEw (R) H, W“@?ﬁ”%wm w“?ﬁﬂﬁ”wﬁam»
S, .
' RV Ok ;
ammmm(ﬁﬁa?mﬁrﬁamaﬂr@msﬁ)a@ﬁw 22\92
<hT M.

9R. FEAYSY TSI I W1 §U ®U H ioass yardt wHer (Friem =t fafrm st den wd) wwu%wmaﬁ
aifyfEm, VR (RRWR H 30) (Gﬁmmﬁmmwaﬁmﬂ%wﬁﬁﬁe%)ﬁm w1 g w §

mﬁsa%mmfmﬂﬁrﬁmﬁfﬂaﬁmm ' ?’i‘jm

23. I sIfufrm F, oI ¥ ¥, Y (3) H, of form % T W HleF wfa e S ok e v
deavarq Frafafea otgs Siel g, i — v
“qeeg af riemat fueptl R IR () % 7 TG WA R ST i aiiE 9 |
fe ¥ it B whage oy wia i fhan S R, a9 PR e w9 9
R Tz T wuzn s,

It 3T

TreX Ul SwHeR ifufEd, Q&L o Hvier

Q¥. AEAYRY US4 w1 of] g &9 H Hiex ufaed wHar sifuf@m, 2’8 (2%&R &1 R9) (S wommder w1 =
70 9§ TR T g9 SutEE F W @ fiide ¥) w, @ am § sud v Swifug §fq § @] ge ww #

. %]&L T 3G F

qu. & afufem A, 9 3 6, suuE (R) #, ol form & wm W A S| R g Sl e g i
Iu vy Frafafa wege s fea s, sl — _



958 (6)

YW U9, feish 27 EwR 2015

YN W W
wfaua Ere:
faftrlt & orefiwr
STORTE T YT,

qegyeyr g o
*fau= T
- fafe=l & eneiw
faf=t v =
U & darur
aur fafi weRr
&t faacforat

uea forg @ @

‘e i Fafea AT g ST e P ST 3 v @ A fe Y ety % ofle
H1E wfrepe oW wita el foran o § A ARt W 9 9 T fean T "
ST

umT
i o faftrel & orefi™ quwrel’ ot wyTHe | fa=iRuT T 33Uy

8. () Tr=fafea sifufem, safq — _
(tw) g9 aigfhe aifuf=m, 208 ({68 T y);

(ﬁ) g fafy (forarool 7 oit Tt e @ S T 1 ge) sifufrm, 1’ee (3j¢¢
F u); '

() —ram "It srfufem, équ (2R%¥¢ & zz);
(IR) wsigl Her Irfufm, 238 (z%aa EQl X)

(ui=) Torera dad wHar (Ja ) afufem, 2jus (198 H2R); H Sfafdwe fadl am@
¥ TN 3T Y, T WER g, Aty g, 59 Fift it W sifte,—

(%) 3 stfufrael % et wem R HIfa fFe T steren gd # iR Fee R | gusE
et erquy w1, (afe BE @), < o w1 FHremafy w1 STEEH 8 S % 9w,
sfriem wftaa frg w9 % qd stere 3H% TR AR H erfasad Ui @
st fofg oTauy % forg sifushan SREY & o8 ¥ o= TR Yok O
Tfer g w S fF o7 Sfaa 99, TR R "R, e

(@)ﬁ&faﬁaﬁ%aeﬁqumaﬂwﬁﬁmm FHia A o 1 A" T % FREH
A Ut Y 1 A A1 SIfiriiem ditea foee ST % 9@ 91 UeEI, T Al a6
¥ HEE ¥ U oy ¥ fAY =AW 9T Ro,000 F HEAHM WA TY
atferera AT W TW T % R AR, & IR a6 F AW H S AqUHi
¥ foTT B9 0,000 AT TF AW G F HREHE ¥ USHE Ut & fag T9Q
30,000 Hﬁﬂmwquﬂm

(R) STUUY &Hi—

() i dfta fve M & 96, wwwz‘raﬁmmﬁraﬁqﬁmmm
& g 3iik afe g sIfiman | § o g & fen e,

) afwﬁmaﬁaaﬁwﬁ%mmmwmﬁaﬁmw%qﬁvmw
m%ﬁa‘xﬁﬁaﬁm

HAT <9

ﬁﬁmmaﬁmﬁmwﬁﬁmmaﬂﬁaﬁmwmm

R
v, Frefafea sifufradl, stafq :—
() @ ga (fafem ok ) afufem, gque (3]0 &1 39);
()  wm ufafre afafEm, 2jes (368 W)
(dF)  wrEr sfufEE, 2% (3R¥¢ H §3);



© HEYRY U9, &R 27 e 2015 "~ 958 (7)

(%m) Aenfirr faar sifufmm, 'zzxxsl(z%m H ¥);

(um) et gerd wHER (e @ et 3 Tar o) arfufEm, 2] (R
T 30); |

(8%) gu fafu (faaolt 3 ok X W § Ffaw o 1 ge) afufEm, 3¢
0 (2R¢L H WR);

(e e AR, 105 (1958 H1 4);
(am3) =[ad wegd dIfufTEm, R3¢ (RR¥¢ H 2R);

() A e FHER afaﬁw 2382 (RRER T QW)
(_EH)‘ SE HEE U, R]8Y (/&Y W RR);
(TIE) U o fufEm, e’ (R]WR W R);
(AE) worgll der Afufrm, 2338 (R]3& H ¥);

(@) o dadw sl (a1 vd) aAfufEm, 2Qes (2%9E &I 2R),

' - ¥ Iuedl H ofafdw fedl @ % TR gE o, T 9@, Wam,mafaﬁmﬁ
e 3% o1 oA U el % eria fafed wedl % e § foRdl FrRiEa stean
quﬁmamww@amwaﬁxmﬁmwm%mmw
Wﬂawafaxﬁaaﬂm

mwm,a:mgﬁgﬁawﬁsﬁmmﬁzﬁﬁmaﬁtafmﬁmﬁaw

HI ST S HHM.
A I qRE
Yehiul 3USe
2¢. (2) 9 R, Td JohieM &1 I % o7eadiF e U, 3 Sifufam & Suedl #l fharafid fem =
FA F wcE A P o w. . 4 ' o,

(Q)svafaﬁmé?wﬂqmmmﬁmmmaﬁ%mawsﬁa ferem
HW%WWT@W@ '

3%, (2) 39 aifufrm & Iweel % foparaam § aft #E FloE Sgy@ €l € A T WER,  wfomdd w1 |
TS F Y WIERer stere fasi STRY gr, 39 Sifufram ¥ Susel @ oF erdvd W Susly s feRar W
TR S HiETE w QW HW F AU 3N snawd stgen @A wda gl

(R) 39N (2) ¥ 34fiF fopan T T oIy faum 9 &% Y9ed W @l S



958 (8) o TEgRY TSI9E, & 27 7R 2015

e, feie 27 @R 2015

F. 8099 A-331-THEIG-37 (WI.)-3fd.—9Rd ¥ UM ¥ ST 348 F WL (3) & SFEY ¥, HEAWRY 99
fafeprt (eitem) oiR weniol Susiy sifufam, 2015 (WP 21 W9 2015) ST SR Tl % WK | TAGERT
yerifa feman T ®. '

TGN % T & AH W qA ST,
TA9T Ired, Sifafiaa wfea.

.MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 21 oF 2015

THE MADHYA PRADESH LABOUR LAWS (AMENDMENT) AND
MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS ACT, 2015

TABLE OF CONTENTS

- Sections:
PART 1
PRELIMINARY
1. Short tital and commencément.
PART 1T

AMENDMENT OF THE BUILDING AND OTHER CONSTRUCTION WORKERS .
(REGULATION OF EMPLOYMENT AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT, 1996

2. Amendment of Central Act No. 27 of 1996 in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh.
3.  Amendment of Section 7. ‘
PART 1II
AMENDMENT OF THE BUILDING AND OTHER CONSTRUCTION WORKERS
WELFARE CESS ACT, 1996

4. Amendment of Central Act No. 28 of 1996 in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh.
5. ‘Amendment of Sections 3 and 11.

PART 1V
AMENDMENT OF THE CONTRACT LABOUR (REGULATION AND ABOLITION) ACT, 1970

=)

Amendment of Central Act No. 37 of 1970 in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh.
7.  Amendment of Sections 7 and 13. '

PART V
AMENDMENT OF THE FACTORIES ACT, 1948

8.  Amendment of Central Act No. 63 of 1948 in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh.
9. Amendment of Sections 65, 66 and 79. '

PART VI
AMENDMENT OF THE INDUSTRIAL DISPUTES ACT, 1947

10. = Amendment of Central Act No. 14 of 1947 in its application to the State of Méldhya Pradesh.
11. Amendment of Sections 2A, 25F and 25K. ,



TEYeY NI, TeAish 27 TR 2015 - 958 (9)

PART VII

AMENDMENT OF THE INTER-STATE MIGRANT WORKMEN (REGULATION OF EMPLOYMENT

12
13.

14.
15.

AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT, 1979

Amendment of Central Act No. 30 of 1979 in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh.
Amendment of Section 4.

PART VIII
AMENDMENT OF THE MOTOR TRANSPORT WORKERS ACT, 1961

Amendment of Central Act No. 27 of 1961 in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh.
Amendment of Section 3. '

"PART IX

COMPOSITION OF OFFENCES AND ABATEMENT OF TRIALS UNDER CERTAIN LABOUR LAWS

16.

17.

18.
19.

Composition of offences under certain Labour laws in the State of Madhya Pradesh.

PART X
EXEMPTION FROM MAINTAINING MULTIPLE REGISTERS AND SUBMISSION OF
MULTIPLE RETURNS '

Exemption from maintaining multiple registers and submission of multiple returns under certain Labour
Laws in the State of Madhya Pradesh. '

PART XI
- MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS

Power to make rules.
Removal of difficulties.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 21 or 2015

THE MADHYA PRADESH LABOUR LAWS (AMENDMENT) AND
MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS ACT, 2015

[Received the assent of the President on the 11" November, 2015 assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette (Extra-ordinary)”,
dated the 27" November, 2015.]

An- Act further to amend the—

@) Building and Other Construction Workers (Regulation of Employment and Conditions of Service)

Act, 1996 (No. 27 of 1996);
(ii) Building and Other Construction Workers’ Welfare Cess Act, 1996 (No. 28 of 1996);
(iit) Contract Labour (Regulation and Abolition) Act, 1970 (No. 37 of 1970);
(iv) Factories Act, 1948 (No. 63 of 1948);
(V) Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (No. 14 of 1947);

(vi) Inter-State Migrant Workmen (Regulatxon of Employment and Conditions of Serv1ce) Act, 1979
(No. 30 of 1979);

(vii) Motor Transport Workers Act, 1961 (No. 27 of 1961).



958 (10)

Heqyey WS, fodis 27 Fera 2015

in their application to the State of Madhya Pradesh and to make miscellaneous provisions regarding other

Labour Laws.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the sixty-sixth year of the Republic of India as follows:—

Shert tital and
commencement.

Amendment of
Central Act No.
27 of 1996 in its
application to the
State of Madhya
Pradesh.

Amendment of
Section 7.

Amendment of
Central Act No.
28 of 1996 in its
application to the
State of Madhya
Pradesh.

Amendment of
Section 3 and 11.

PART 1
PRELIMINARY

1. (1) This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Labour Laws (Amendment) and

Miscellaneous Prov1s1ons Act, 2015.
(2) It shall come into force from the date of its publiéation in the Madhjra Pradesh Gazette.

PART 1I
AMENDMENT OF THE BUILDING AND OTHER CONSTRUCTION WORKERS
(REGULATION OF EMPLOYMENT AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT, 1996

2. The Building and Other Construction Workers (Regulation of Employment and
Conditions of Service) Act, 1996 (No. 27 .of 1996) (hereinafter in this Part referred to as the
principal Act) shall in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh be amended in the manner
hereinafter provided in this Part. '

3. In the pr1nc1pa1 Act, in Section 7, after sub-section (3), the followmg sub-section
shall be 1nserted namely:— .

If no adverse order is passed in regard to registration of establishment by the
Registering Officer within the prescribed period from the date of submission of
application, then the registration shall be deemed to be duly granted.”.

“(3A) .

PART III
AMENDMENT OF THE BUILDING AND OTHER CONSTRUCTION WORKERS
WELFARE CESS ACT, 1996

4. . The Building and Other Construction Workers” Welfare Cess Act, 1996 (No. 28 of
1996) (hereinafter in this Part referred to as the principal Act) shall in its application to the State
of Madhya Pradesh be amended in the manner hereinafter provided in_this Part.

5. In the principal Act,—
6y} in Section 3, after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
\ pamely:— .
“(1A) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), costs incurred on

- purchase and transportation of plant and machinery meant to be used in a
factory and such other costs as may be specified by notificaion issued by the
State Government shall be excluded from the cost of construction incurred by
an employer.”;
(ii) in Section 11, for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely:—

Notwithstanding anything contained in the rules made under this Act, any
employer aggrieved by an order of assessment made under Section 5 or by
an order imposing penalty under Section 9 may, within such time as may be

“(D



“REAYSY TS, i 27 TawR 2015

958 (11)

prescribed, appeal to such appellate authority in such form as may be
prescribed and in such manner as may be specified by the State Government.”.

PART IV
AMENDMENT OF THE CONTRACT LABOUR (REGULATION AND ABOLITION)
ACT, 1970

6. The‘ Contract Labour (Regulation and Abolition) Act, 1970 (No. 37 of 1970)
(hereinafter in this Part referred to as the principal Act) shall in its application to the State of
Madhya Pradesh be amended in the manner hereinafter provided in this Part.

7. In the principal Act,—

@ in Section 7, after sub-section (2), the following new sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(3) Upon submission of an application complete in all respects, in accordance with
sub-section (1), the establishment in respect of which such application is made
shall be deemed to be duly registered if the registering officer fails to pass
an order either granting or refusing or objecting to grant or amend the
registration within a period of 30 days from the date of submlssmn of
application.”;

(i) in Sectlon 13, after sub-section (3) the followmg new sub-section shall be added,
namely:—

Upon submission of an application complete in all respects in accordance with
sub-section (1), the contractor in relation to an establishment in respect of
which such application is made shall be deemed to be duly licensed if the
licensing officer fails to pass an order either granting or refusing or objecting
to grant or renew or amend the license within a period of 30 days from the
date of submission of application.”.

“4)

PART V
AMENDMENT OF THE FACTORIES ACT, 1948

8. The Factories Act, 1948 (No. 63 of 1948) (hereinafter in this Part referred to as the
principal Act) shall in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh be amended in the manner
hereinafter provided in this Part.

9. In the principal Act,—
) in Section 65,—
(@) sub-section (2) shall be deleted;
(b) fbr sub-section (3), thé following sub-section shall be-substituted,.namely:—

“‘(3) (a) Notwithstanding anything contained in sections 51, 52, 54 and 56, an adult
male worker may be allowed to work in a factory for more than 48 hours
in a week subject to fulfitment of following conditions:—

@) the total number of hours of work in any day shall not exceed twelve;

(i)

the spread over, inclusive of intervals for rest,.shall not exceed thirteen
hours in any one day;

Amendment of
Central Act No.
37 of 1970 in its
application to the
State of Madhya
Pradesh.

Amendment of
Section 7 and 13.

Amendment of
Central Act No.
63 of 1948 in its
application to the
State of Madhya
Pradesh.

Amendment of
Section 65, 66
and 79.



958 (12) _ HeauRy s, A 27 TR 2015

(iri) the total number of hours of work in any week, including _overtime, shall
not exceed sixty;

3iv) no worker shall be allowed to work overtime, for more than seven days
at a stretch and the total number of hours of overtime work in any
quarter shall not exceed-one hundred and twenty five;

v(v) such overtime work shall not be made compulsory or obligatory for any
worker.

(b) The occupier shall maintain information of working hours and overtime
work of workers in such manner as may be prescribed.

Explanation.—In this sub-section “quarter” has the same meaning as in
sub-section (4) of section 64.”;

(>ii) in Section 66,—
(@) in sub-section (1), clause (b) and proviso shall be omitted;
(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(1A) The State Government may, by order, specify conditions for ensuring safety
of women who are required or allowed to work in any factory or
manufacturing process between the hours of 8 PM. and 6 A M.”;

(iiiy = in Section 79, for sub-section (1) and Explanation 1, the following sub-section
and Explanation shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1) . Every worker who has worked for a period of 180 days or more in a factory
' during a calender year shall be allowed during the same calendar year, leave
with wages for a number of days calculated at the rate of—

@) if an adult, one day for every twenty days of work performed by him dunng
the calender year;

(ii) if a_child, one day for every fifteen days of work performed by him during
the calendar year :

Explanatlon 1.—For the purpose of this sub-section—

(a) any days of lay-off, by agreement or contract or as permlss1ble under
the standing orders; '

(b) in the case of a female worker, maternity leave for any number of days
not exceeding twelve weeks; and

(c) ~ the leave earned in the year prior to that in which the leave is enjoyed,

shall be deemed to be days on which the worker has worked in a factory for
the purpose of computation of the period of 180 days or more.”.

~ PART VI
AMENDMENT OF THE INDUSTRIAL DISPUTES ACT, 1947

Amendment of 10. The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (No. 14 of 1947) (hereinafter in this Part referred. to
f:T;?9$c§n§?§ as the principal Act) shall in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh be amended in the

application to the Mmanner hereinafter provided in this Part.
State of Madhya

Pradesh.

Amendment of 11. In the principal Act,—

Sections 2A, 25F :

and 25K. @) in Section 2-A, in sub-section (3), for the words “the Labour Court or Tribunal”,

the words “the Labour Court or Tribunal or Conciliation Officer” shall be



TEAYSE ToTed, feie 27 e 2015

958 (13)

substit_uted;

@i1) in Section 25F—
(a) in clause (a), for the words “one month’s notice”, the words “three month’s
notice” shall be substituted;

(b) for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(b) the workman has been paid, at the time of retrenchment, compensation
which shall be equivalent to fifteen days’ average pay for every completed
year of continuous service or any part thereof in excess of six months, or
an amount equivalent to his three months’ average pay, whichever is more;

and”;

in Section 25K, in sub section (1), for the words “one hundred”, the words “three
hundred” shall be substituted.

(iii)

- PART VII
AMENDMENT OF THE INTER-STATE MIGRANT WORKMEN (REGULATION OF
EMPLOYMENT AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT, 1979

12. The Inter—State Migrant Workmen (Regulation of Employment and Conditions of Service)
Act, 1979 (No. 30 of 1979) (hereinafter in this Part referred to as the pr1nc1pal Act) shall in its
.application to the State of Madhya Pradesh be amended in the manner hereinafter provided in
this Part. ~

13. In the principal Act, in Section 4, in sub-section (‘3), for full stop, the colon shall be
substituted and thereafter the following proviso shall be added, namely:— ’

“Provided that if no adverse order is passed by the Registering Officer within thirty days

from the date of submission of application under sub-section (1), then the,

registration shall be deemed to be duly granted.”.

' : PART VIII
AMENDMENT OF THE MOTOR TRANSPORT WORKERS ACT, 1961

14. The Motor Traﬁsport Workers Act, 1961 (No. 27 of 1961) (hereinafter in this Part referred
" to as the principal Act) shall in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh be amended in the
manner hereinafter provided in this Part.

15. In the principal Act, in Section 3, in sub-section (2), for full stop, the colon shall be
“substituted and thereafter the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

"Provided that if no adverse order is passed by the prescribed authority within a period

of 30 days from the date of submission of application, then the registration shall

be deemed to be duly granted.”.-
PART IX

COMPOSITION OF OFFENCES AND ABATEMENT OF TRIALS UNDER CERTAIN
LABOUR LAWS

16.(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in the following Acts, namely

Amendment of
Central Act No.
30 of 1979 in its
application teo the
State of Madhya

Pradesh. )

. Amendment of

Section 4.

Amendment of
Central Act No.
27 of 1961 in its
application to the
State of Madhya
Pradesh.

Amendment of
Section 3.

Composition of
offences under
certain Labour
Laws in the State
of . Madhya
Pradesh.



958 (14) : Tyl U9, feie 27 R 2015

(1) Equal Remuneratlon Act, 1976 (No 25 of 1976); : _

(ii) Labour Laws (Exemption from Furnishing Returns and Maintaining Registers by
certain Establishments) Act, 1988 (No. 51 of 1988);

(iii) Minimum Wages Act, 1948 (No. 11 of 1948);

@iv) Payment of Wages Act, 1936 (No. 4 of 1936);

) Sales Promotion Employees (Condmons of Service) Act, 1976 (No. 11 of 1976)

an officer authorised by the State Government in this behalf by notifiicaton may
compound.

(a) any offence punishable with only fine under these Acts commltted for the first
time or after expiry of a period of two years of commitment of pervious
offence (if any), either before or after institution of the prosecution, on
realization of such amount of composition fee, as he thinks fit, not exceeding
the maximum amount of fine but not less than half of the maximum amount
of fine for the offence, or '

b) any offence pusishable with fine and imprisonment up to three months under
these Acts committed for the first time, either before or after institution of
the prosecution, on realization of composition fee of an amount equivalent to
ten times of the maximum fine subject to a minimum of Rs. 10,000 for
offences punishable with imprisonment up to one month Rs. 20,000 for
offences punishable with imprisonment up to two months or Rs. 30,000 for
offences punishable with imprisonment up to three months.

(2) When the offence is so compounded—

@G) before the institution of the prosecution the offender shall not be 11ab1e to
prosecution and shall, if in custody, be set at liberty;

(ii) after the institution of prosecution, the composition shall amount to acquittal of
- the offender. : .

PART X

EXEMPTION FROM MAINTAINING MULTIPLE REGISTERS AND SUBMISSION OF
MULTIPLE RETURNS
Exemption from 17. Notwithstanding anything contained in the provisions of the following Acts, namely :—
maintaining E : :
multiple registers )
and submission of @) Contract Labour (Regulation and Abolition) Act, 1970 (No. 37 of 1970);
multiple returns . .
under  certain (ii) Equal Remuneration Act, 1976 (No. 25 of 1976);
Labour Laws in )
the State of )
Madhya Pradesh, - (iii) - Factories Act, 1948 (No. 63 of 1948);

@iv) Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (No. 14 of 1947);

) Inter-State Migrant Workmen (Regulation of Employment and Conditions of
Service) Act, 1979 (No. 30 of 1979);

(vi) Labour Laws (Exemption from Furnishing Returns and Maintaining Registers by
certain Establishments) Act, 1988 (No. 51 of 1988);

(viiy  Maternity Benefit Act, 1961 (No. 53 of 1961);

(viii)  Minimum Wages Act, 1948 (No. 11 of 1948);



Heagy o, i 27 Tawr 2015 . 958 (15)

(ix) Motor Transport Wbrkers Act; 1961 (No. 27 of 1961);

) Payment of Bonué Act, 1965 (No. 21 of 1965);

(xi) Payment of Gratuity Act, 1972 (No. 39 of 1972);

(xii)  Payment of Wages Act, 1936 (No. 4 of 1936);

(xiii)  Sales Promotion Employees (Conditions of Service) Act, 1976 (No. 11 of 1976);

the State Government by order may devise or notify forms for maintaining
registers and records and furnishing returns by an employer or establishment in
lieu of the forms prescribed under the said Acts and the rules made thereunder:

Provided that the State Government may allow the reglsters and records to
be maintained in computerised or digital formats.

PART XI
MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS

~ 18. (1) The State Government, subject to the condition of previous publication, may make Power to make
rules for the purpose of giving effect to the provisions of this Act; rules.

(2) All rules made under thls Act shall, as soon as after they are made, be la1d on the
table of the Legislative Assembly. :

19. (1) If any difficulty arises. in giving effect to the provisions of this Act, the State Removal of
Government may, by general or special order published in the Gazette, make such provision not difficulties.
inconsistent with the provisions of this Act as appear to it to be necessary or expendient for
removal of the difficulty.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (1) shall be laid on the iable of the Legislative
Assembly. ‘

iz, T g0 9 oEE i, HEIIRY BRI YR i RUTerd, utel ¥ qfkd qo yehifi—2015.



